Support replied (Mon, 28 Oct 2024 at 9:30 PM)
To: "PDC Support" pdc@pdc.wa.gov

External Email
Ms. Blacksmith,

Thanks for the email, and notice regarding dismissal of the allegation concerning the photo in
uniform. I'm assuming a response to that allegation is not necessary, but please let me know if
this 1s not correct.

My response to the remaining two allegations is as follows:

Allegation One, failing to timely and accurately report the expenditure for the postcards sent in
October, is unfounded. The expenditure was made in two parts, the first from a personal
checking account in the late evening of October 14, 2024, and the second with a credit card in
the morning of October 15, 2024, both after the filing of the October 14, 2024 C4

report. See attached emails. Both expenditures posted to my personal accounts, the first to
checking and the second to a credit card, on October 15, 2024, again, after the October 14, 2024
C4 had been filed. See attached redacted account statements. So, as I understand it, this was an
October 15, 2024 expenditure and the report of this expenditure is not due until tomorrow,
October 29, 2024.

That said, I do have a question as to how to properly report this expense. I paid for this expense
from my personal account because our campaign account had insufficient funds. So, I tried to
report it as an in-kind contribution for the total of $6,050.07. See attached redacted account
statements. Again, I did this because the funds did not go into or come out of the campaign
account. My report of this in-kind contribution comes up when I perform a "contribution search"
but I cannot find a way to file it. Could you assist with this?

Allegation Two, allegedly using public agency resources to assist an election campaign through
use of a courtroom photo is also unfounded. The photo in question was taken from a video shot,
produced, and published by King 5 News and posted to YouTube, see Robbrie Thompson
sentenced to 40 years for 2019 murder of Puyallup store clerk. It included footage of me arguing
in court. The video was taken without my knowledge or prior permission by a person not
employed by Pierce County while I was engaged in the normal and regular conduct of my work.
Therefore, no public resources were used or authorized to be used in the production of this photo
and it is not violative of RCW 42.17.555. I have, however, removed this photo from my website
pending your decision.

Lastly, I would note that the complainant seems to indicate in his apparent LinkedIn profile that
he is a "Consultant at Progressive Strategies NW," which, per its website, "brings... passion for
electing great candidates." This seems to suggest an ulterior motive of unnecessarily hampering
my campaign, which is not guided by a consultant, but a lawyer seeking to make the court
system more just and efficient.


https://wapdc.freshdesk.com/a/contacts/13073155619
mailto:pdc@pdc.wa.gov
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=j2d8vEPbbtc
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=j2d8vEPbbtc

I want to assist you and ensure my compliance with applicable law and regulation. So, please let
me know if you need anything additional from me or have further questions or concerns.

Thank you,

Brian Wasankari
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From: Brian W. <brian@brian4judge.coms>

Sent: Tuesday, October 15, 2024 12:47 PM

To: Katrina Apgar <KatrinaB@printnw.net>

Cc: Zoe Stoy <zoes@printnw.net>; Kevin Harris <KevinH@printnw.net>
Subject: Re: 5.5 X 8.5 Postcard Mailer #2 - D420174

Katrina,

I'm sorry, | didn't see this until now. | tried to pay twice, and it looks as though at least the second transaction went through (transaction #613350024).

I'm assuming you can mail these by tomorrow morning, but please confirm.

Thank you.

On Tue, Oct 15, 2024 at 7:36 AM Katrina Apgar <KatrinaB@printnw.net> wrote:

Good Morning Brian,

I’m Katrina and work with Zoe & Kevin @

We recetved postage payment — Thank you!! We haven’t seen that the print invoice has been paid yet. We do need payment by 10am this morning to get this to the post office. I've attached the invoice that needs payment.



.

M Gmail Brian Wasankari <admin201@briand4judge.com> .

5.5 X 8.5 Postcard Mailer #2 - D420174

oe Stoy <zoes@printnw.net>
o: "brian@brian4judge.com" <brian@brian4judge.com>, Katrina Apgar <KatrinaB@printnw.net>
Cc: Kevin Harris <KevinH@printnw_net>

I

Tue, Oct 15, 2024 g

e got your payment! @ These should still be okay to drop today.

Customer Service Supervisor

PRINT NW

9914 32nd Ave S | Lakewood | WA | 98499

Tel: 253-650-0935

zoes@PrintNW.net | www.printnw.net | Upload Files Here

To learn more about our new proofing platform click here.

aBook time to meet with me



Oct 15,2024  PRINT NW 2532842300 WA $2,882.34 $2,979.79



Oct 15, 2024 SUNDANCE CAFE TACOMA WA 047928 10/15(...3581)  Card -$15.14

PRINT NW 253-2842300 WA 10/15 (...3581) Card =$3,167.73
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