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Download 44 rows as CSV.

Chevron, Chewelah 07/28/2024 fuel Chewelah WA $126.40
View

Report

Chevron, Chewelah 07/28/2024 Fair Supplies Chewelah WA $46.53
View

Report

Chevron, Chewelah 07/05/2024 fuel Chewelah WA $109.04
View

Report

Eagle Newspapers, Inc 10/03/2024 2nd flyer Salem OR $6,605.00
View

Report

Eagle Newspapers, Inc 07/28/2024 flyer Salem OR $6,605.00
View

Report

EXPENSES OF $200.00 OR

LESS
07/01/2024 $1,021.98

View

Report

EXPENSES OF $200.00 OR

LESS
06/01/2024 $611.55

View

Report

EXPENSES OF $200.00 OR

LESS
05/01/2024 $147.77

View

Report

Lutgen Senit 06/03/2024 consulting/strategy Colville WA $250.00
View

Report

Lutgen Senit 05/31/2024
Management and consulting

services
Spokane WA $250.00

View

Report

Lutgen Senit 05/01/2024 consulting/strategy Spokane WA $250.00
View

Report

Recipient  Date  Description 
Recipient
City 

Recipient
State  Amount  Report 
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N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 09/12/2024
pay for ad in Republican voter

guide
$356.35

View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 09/12/2024 Walt's mail service $524.50
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 09/01/2024 Ferry County Fair $30.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 09/01/2024 Cattleman's Association $1,590.20
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 08/10/2024 Valley Fair $50.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 08/03/2024 Brickyard Days Parade $50.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 08/03/2024 Newport Rodeo $50.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 07/31/2024 Clayton Community Fair $75.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 07/27/2024 Selkirk Trailblazers $10.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 07/27/2024 Clayton Community Fair $25.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 07/27/2024 Masonic Lodge $50.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 07/16/2024 Opie-Cox Golf Tourney $70.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 07/12/2024 Clayton Comm. Fair Rodeo $125.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 07/10/2024 Ferry County Fair $50.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 07/10/2024 Pend Oreille County Fair $75.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 07/04/2024 Charity $25.00
View

Report

N Smith "Smitty" Hagopian 07/04/2024 NE WA Fair/parade $50.00
View

Report

Recipient  Date  Description 
Recipient
City 

Recipient
State  Amount  Report 
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Showing 1 to 44 of 44 entries

Presscats 09/08/2024 fuel spokane wa $53.26
View

Report

Presscats 08/29/2024 signs spokane wa $624.08
View

Report

Presscats 07/10/2024 signs spokane wa $619.06
View

Report

Presscats 06/27/2024 signs/flyers spokane wa $268.73
View

Report

Presscats 06/23/2024 signs spokane wa $1,353.95
View

Report

Presscats 05/19/2024
Bank and payment processing

charges
spokane wa $2,988.59

View

Report

Presscats 05/19/2024 signs spokane wa $2,988.59
View

Report

Secretary of State 05/12/2024 Filing fees Olympia WA $2,173.91
View

Report

The Miner Newspaper 10/10/2024 newspaper ad Newport WA $376.80
View

Report

The Miner Newspaper 08/13/2024 newspaper ad Newport WA $235.50
View

Report

The Miner Newspaper 07/26/2024 newspaper ad Newport WA $235.50
View

Report

The Miner Newspaper 07/12/2024 Newspaper ad Newport WA $471.00
View

Report

WalMart 08/22/2024 Fair supplies colville WA $122.61
View

Report

WalMart 07/21/2024 marketing items for Fairs colville WA $152.08
View

Report

WA State PDC 05/12/2024
Bank and payment processing

charges
Olympia WA $2,173.91

View

Report

WP GOZOEK.COM 07/02/2024 website Irvine CA $999.00
View

Report

Recipient  Date  Description 
Recipient
City 

Recipient
State  Amount  Report 

Previous Next1
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Conner Edwards <cg.edwards53@gmail.com>

Book Inspection Request (Hagopian)
Conner Edwards <cg.edwards53@gmail.com> Wed, Oct 30, 2024 at 12:18 PM
To: Smitty Hagopian <smittyforjudge@gmail.com>

Perfect, I appreciate that. 

As long as you provide the following three records in full, that's all I want: 

1) Bank statements for the campaign account from the month the account was created to present.  
2) All receipts/invoices/records associated with expenditures, in-kind contributions, and debts. 
3) The images associated with each check/deposit made into the campaign account.

On Wed, Oct 30, 2024 at 12:16 PM Smitty Hagopian <smittyforjudge@gmail.com> wrote:

Hello again. I just got off the phone with my bank and am on my way to the branch to get help, printing out the campaign account in full and then the various
personal checks that are relevant. I will scan and email that data to you as soon as I have it, but by no means later than 6 pm tonight probably much sooner.

That work? Thanks

On Wed, Oct 30, 2024, 12:12 PM Conner Edwards <cg.edwards53@gmail.com> wrote:
Hello: 

Sorry to keep pressing this issue, but my original request to inspect your books was for Monday (October 28, 2024) at 11:00 AM. The guidance on the PDC's
website says: "If it is not possible to schedule the records inspection at the day or time requested, the committee must make the records available for inspection
within 48 hours of the requested time." It has now been over 48 hours since the time period I requested to make the inspection. 

If you need additional time to figure out how to attach the records and send them to me, I'm OK with that, but can you commit to a time when you will provide
these records? Your e-mail implies that you might not allow for the inspection of these records. 

-Conner 

On Tue, Oct 29, 2024 at 11:49 PM Smitty Hagopian <smittyforjudge@gmail.com> wrote:

If I can figure out how, I will. But gotta sleep now.

On Tue, Oct 29, 2024, 11:27 PM Conner Edwards <cg.edwards53@gmail.com> wrote:
Thanks for the response, and I admit this whole process is a little confusing and cumbersome. The PDC does explain the book inspection process here: 
https://www.pdc.wa.gov/rules-enforcement/guidelines-restrictions/public-inspection-campaign-records   

Essentially, I am only looking for you to provide the following records: 

1) Bank statements for the campaign account from the month the account was created to present.  
2) All receipts/invoices/records associated with expenditures, in-kind contributions, and debts. 
3) The images associated with each check/deposit made into the campaign account.

You should just be able to upload those all as attachments and send them to me at this e-mail address, which should be pretty quick and easy. 

Can you confirm that you'll be providing these records to me by the end of the day tomorrow? 

-Conner 

On Tue, Oct 29, 2024 at 10:50 PM Smitty Hagopian <smittyforjudge@gmail.com> wrote:

I have no idea how to do that. All of my transactions were either through my campaign account credit card, of which there is a complete record in the
bank statements, or by personal check, of which there is a complete bank record.

My bank, STCU, does have online banking which I use, so there are images of the checks I wrote there, but I did not keep any receipts or record of the
transactions in any other form, knowing I had the bank records to rely on.

I can ask my bank how to provide those records maybe on a flash drive? Or some other way to send them via email.

Or do you know how to walk me through that so that I can get it all to you electronically?

Are you asking for me to print out the bank records hard copy and scan them to you if electronics can't be done?

I'm not trying to evade anything, but I was only ever audited once, many years ago (2003?). I just don't know what you're looking for so not sure how best
to get what you want.

Smitty

On Tue, Oct 29, 2024, 5:40 PM Conner Edwards <cg.edwards53@gmail.com> wrote:
Sounds good! Can you send me the receipts/invoices/check images to my email by tomorrow night? 

Best, 

Conner Edwards
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(425) 533-1677 cell 

On Tue, Oct 29, 2024 at 5:38 PM Smitty Hagopian <smittyforjudge@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Mr  Edwards  However imperfectly, I think I've caught up with my books  I will check with the PDC support folks tomorrow when they come back
to work but I think I'm done and accurate.

I do not know how to get you the information electronically however. It is a public record, isn't it? - so are you able to access it without me doing
something beyond my current knowledge? - I can be taught however... :).

However you want/need to see it, I am available tomorrow after work or Thursday too. Ijust need to know if I need to bring this old boat anchor laptop
to be able to show you if we are going to meet in person. Otherwise I leave it at home.

Thanks,

smitty

509-670-1491

On Mon, Oct 28, 2024 at 6:41 AM Smitty Hagopian <smittyforjudge@gmail.com> wrote:

Perfect. Thanks

On Sun, Oct 27, 2024, 11:09 PM Conner Edwards <cg.edwards53@gmail.com> wrote:
Sounds good! Let’s plan on doing the inspection digitally after hours. Let me know what your availability is like Wednesday to Thursday after
work. I should be just about completely free. 

Best, 

Conner Edwards
(425) 533-1677 cell 

On Sun, Oct 27, 2024 at 8:13 PM Smitty Hagopian <smittyforjudge@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Mr. Edwards.

I'm happy to have you inspect my books but I think they will be dismally un updated by 11 00 tomorrow, and perhaps more importantly for
scheduling, I will be in court most of tomorrow and certainly at 11:00, as that's when we have our 1st appearances scheduled with the jail and
court for new arrests over the weekend.

I was off the grid since Tuesday afternoon on an annual trip with my distant (geographically) family and just came back to coverage late last
night. My first concern is to get these books into conformity. It's my intent to bring them to the attention of the PDC support staff tomorrow
sometime when they have time as I have done once in the past to get their help to update my data onto their form properly. I have been
keeping track of my expenditures all along but have not been able to navigate the PDC website successfully on my own, and as I write that, I
recognize how ridiculous it sounds, but it is nonetheless the truth, and I have tried to navigate it  I am going to try again tonight

I have court all day Tuesday as well but Wednesday is usually much less defined so that would work better for me, but I am also able to meet
with you online after hours if the timing is more critical.

My cell is 509-670-1491 and I am happy to talk through my list if that would help too. I/my campaign am/is entirely self funded, for what that's
worth.

Thanks,

Smitty Hagopian

On Sat, Oct 26, 2024 at 2:13 PM Conner Edwards <cg.edwards53@gmail.com> wrote:
Hello: 

Per RCW 42.17A.235 and WAC 390-16-043, I am requesting to inspect the books of your 2024 political committee. I noticed that you still
haven't filed 21-day pre-general C4. 

Here is a link from the PDC's website about the book inspection process: https://www.pdc.wa.gov/rules-enforcement/guidelines-
restrictions/public-inspection-campaign-records  

I would like to inspect the book on Monday (October 28, 2024) at 11:00 AM. It would be my preference to inspect the records digitally, but if
you'd like me to come to meet you in person we could arrange that also  

If that time doesn't work,  please let me know of another time that would work for you. I am happy to meet after hours or during the weekend
if that works better for you. 

--

Best, 

Conner Edwards
(425) 533-1677 cell 

--
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Best, 

Conner Edwards
(425) 533-1677 cell 

--

Best, 

Conner Edwards
(425) 533-1677 cell 

--

Best, 

Conner Edwards
(425) 533-1677 cell 
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Conner Edwards <cg.edwards53@gmail.com>

checks from my personal account used for in-kind payments for the campaign
Conner Edwards <cg.edwards53@gmail.com> Wed, Oct 30, 2024 at 10:08 PM
To: Smith Hagopian <shagopian@stevenscountywa.gov>

Thank you for the response. I've already provided a list of what I'm looking for. You have not provided me with the records that you are required to provide me with.
From your e-mail, it sounds like you have not even maintained the required records. I don't think it would be useful for us to continue to go back and forth like this. 

If you don't provide me with your books of account by 9:00 PM tomorrow (10/31/24), I intend to file a PDC complaint against your campaign. If you are still interested
in trying to comply, I would encourage you to call the PDC at (360) 753-1111 to learn more about how to comply with the book inspection requirement. 

-Conner 

On Wed, Oct 30, 2024 at 8:50 PM Smith Hagopian <shagopian@stevenscountywa.gov> wrote:
Hi Mr. Edwards.

I made transfers of money from one STCU account, to the campaign account, also an STCU account, as needed, to pay the campaign costs identified in the
printouts I sent. Again, the money came from me. I got divorced this year and we i*sold our house and I am building a new house here, so I have a "House"
account from which I took/transferred money into my campaign account as needed.

Perhaps if I knew what you were looking for I could supply it?

What "ledger of transactions kept current within one business day"? Until this last week, maybe 2 weeks, I paid my credit card bill in full each month. More recently
I was only able to pay 4000 at the due date so there was 3300 + left over to pay, which I did yesterday. All from my "House" fund at STCU, which was mostly
funded by divorce property distribution at leastl initially.

I'm not trying to be obtuse. As I was updating my PDC info I was referring to the campaign account in my online banking, and it listed how much and when I made
deposits into the campaign account. I don't have the documents that I emailed to you here at home, I left them at the office in case I needed them again tomorrow,
but aren't those deposits shown on the bank/credit card statements I sent?

Are you looking for the source of the "house" account funds? We sold 663 19th St NE,  East Wenatchee, 98802, in 2023. We each got some proceeds. My soon to
be ex wife had a mysterious medical concern so until we knew what was what with respect to that, we did not divide that asset/equity until she had insurance
through her new employer. Also why we did not get divorced for some time after separated - her medical concern and insurance coverage.

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone
Get Outlook for Android

From: Conner Edwards <cg.edwards53@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 30, 2024 5:34:15 PM
To: Smith Hagopian <shagopian@stevenscountywa.gov>
Subject: Re: checks from my personal account used for in-kind payments for the campaign
 
Thank you, although this appears to only be a very small portion of what I’m looking for. 

Where are the images of the deposits made into your campaign bank account? Where is the ledger of transactions kept current within one business day? Where
are the receipts/invoices for the campaign expenditures? 
L

Best, 

Conner Edwards
(425) 533-1677 cell 

On Wed, Oct 30, 2024 at 5:31 PM Smith Hagopian <shagopian@stevenscountywa.gov> wrote:

Hi Mr. Edwards. 

 

I have sent you all the checks I have that were used by me for the campaign out of my personal account, attached here.

 

Note that there are 2 that are not accounted for in that they have never been deposited. They are check # 1548, which was written to the Lakeside Chamber of
Commerce for $25.00 on July 4, for the Parade entry in Nine Mile Falls. The other one is check # 1565, in the amount of $50.00 written on August 3rd for the
Clayton Brickyard Days parade entry.

 

Please le me know if you think there may be something else you need.

 

To be clear, I did not save any receipts of any purchases as I was very careful to only use either the credit card specifically dedicated to and only for campaign
expenses which I sent you previously today, or these several personal checks. I’m not a guy who carries or uses cash very much - ever.
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I will check for your response on my personal email accounts (gmail) when I get home tonight.

 

Thanks,

 

smitty

 

From: ProsAtty_Bizhub@stevenscountywa.gov <ProsAtty_Bizhub@stevenscountywa.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, October 30, 2024 3:28 PM
To: Smith Hagopian <shagopian@stevenscountywa.gov>
Subject: Message from KM_C451i

 

 

Best, 

Conner Edwards
(425) 533-1677 cell 
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--

 

Best, 

 

Conner Edwards

(425) 533 1677 cell 

--

Best, 

Conner Edwards
(425) 533 1677 cell 
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Conner Edwards <cg.edwards53@gmail.com>

public records inspection request from Smitty Hagopian
Smith Hagopian <shagopian@stevenscountywa.gov> Wed, Oct 30, 2024 at 1:00 PM
To: "cg.edwards53@gmail.com" <cg.edwards53@gmail.com>

Hi Mr. Edwards. Here’s the credit card data from my campaign account.

 

I’m working on the check images – hard to get them to print so I can send them

 

From: ProsAtty_Bizhub@stevenscountywa.gov <ProsAtty_Bizhub@stevenscountywa.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, October 30, 2024 12:50 PM
To: Smith Hagopian <shagopian@stevenscountywa.gov>
Subject: Message from KM_C451i

 

 

SKM_C451i24103012490.pdf
716K





Additionally, the respondent used his official government e-mail address for campaign purposes: 
specifically, by corresponding with me in relation to my request to inspect his campaign’s books of 
account. See attached e-mail threads.  

Additionally, the respondent failed to provide his complete books of account to me after I requested 
to view them. See attached. This is a violation of RCW 42.17A.235(6).  

Additionally, this candidate failed to include virtually any of the details which agency staff believe to 
be required for expenditures, including: the address/name of subvendors, the number of printed 
items, the run date of newspaper ads, etc. Additionally, he misattributed his filing fee to the PDC. 
See attached.  

Finally, this candidate filed an almost certainly inaccurate C4 report covering the month of 
November on October 30. See link: https://apollo.pdc.wa.gov/public/registrations/campaign-
finance-report/110257505  

Conclusion 

I urge the PDC staff to take quick action and resolve the noncompliance identified in this complaint.  

Best,  

/s/  

Conner Edwards 
(425) 533-1677 cell  
 
Notice to Respondent 

 

I apologize to you for any inconvenience caused by this complaint. The chance that you will actually be 

fined for the violations identified above is extremely small because the agency is averse to doing the work 

necessary to bring cases to hearings. Most likely this case – and any future cases against you – will 

simply be dismissed by staff with a so-called "warning letter".  

 

This complaint is one of hundreds that I have filed to highlight and ultimately fix the significant 

shortcomings associated with the agency responsible for administering our state’s campaign finance 

laws.   

 

What are these shortcomings? 

 

Overcomplicated and outdated requirements that are difficult to understand and comply with. Failure to 

properly educate the regulated community about the tasks they must perform to remain in compliance 

with applicable requirements and avoid complaints. Failure of the agency to send regular reminders to 

filers about pending deadlines. A failure to proactively enforce applicable requirements which enables the 

complaint system to become weaponized. Non-intuitive, non-user friendly, and buggy reporting software. 

Failure to meaningfully enforce core requirements. Failure to follow the best operating practices of other 

neighboring campaign finance agencies.  An agency leadership structure that largely disregards 

stakeholder input and is slow to identify and resolve major agency deficiencies. 

 



I believe that the best way to motivate the agency to address these problems is by filing a large number of 

complaints so that the agency’s problems become impossible to ignore.   

 

Slowly (too slowly) this strategy is starting to yield concrete and beneficial changes. You can read about 

these changes here: https://www.seattletimes.com/seattle-news/politics/why-one-man-filed-800-

campaign-finance-complaints-against-wa-candidates/   

 

If you believe that the agency could have done something different to help you proactively avoid the 

issues identified in this complaint, I hope that you will consider including it in your response. The agency, 

and the public, can benefit from your perspective and feedback.   

 

“The journey of a thousand miles begins with a single step.” 
― Lao Tzu  
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