Andrew Gnaneswaran replied Mon, 4 Mar 2024
To: PDC Support

Following up our phone conversation, here are the documents stating we were approved for the $2000
from the Washington State Democratic Central Committee. There is an email change between them and
our Chair, Joe Bruening as well as the bank documents of when the check was deposited.

Andrew Gnaneswaran replied Tue, 5 Mar 2024

To: PDC Support

The check was mailed out on August 23rd but | didn't physically receive the check until August 30th.
See attached image of the letter of when the mail was sent.

Sincerely,

Andrew Gnaneswaran



From: Joe Bruening <jbruening777@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 23, 2023 1:30 PM

To: Drew Estep

Cc: Shasti Conrad; mandalynnwa@gmail.com; Justin Allen; andrewgwaran1@gmail.com
Subject: RE: Congratulations! Your Local Organization Grant has been approved

Yes, | confirm these details.

Joe Bruening

From: Drew Estep
Sent: Wednesday, August 23, 2023 1:19 PM

To: Jbruening
Cc: Shasti Conrad

Subject: Re: Congratulations! Your Local Organization Grant has been approved

Hi Joe,

Following up on Shasti’s note here. The deadline here has passed. Please confirm details before tomorrow, August 24,
or we will distribute your funds to organizations that were held as back-ups.

Drew

On Tue, Aug 15, 2023 at 7:16 PM Shasti Conrad <chair@wa-democrats.org> wrote:

Hi Joe,

Congratulations! Your grant has been approved by the WSD Finance Committee at their most recent meeting. Thank
you for your submission and we appreciate the work you put into the grant proposal. Please confirm the below
information regarding your grant and that you are able to accept a check for the funds granted at the address provided
below. If you do not confirm before Sunday, August 20 funds will not be distributed and another organization's grant
proposal will be funded instead.

Organization/s receiving funds: LD 49
Amount funded: $2,000.00

Address/es to be mailed to: 7010 NE 56th Street, Vancouver, WA 98661



Mini Filer Status: Yes (if yes, and receiving more than $500, please confirm that this status is currently being changed or
that no more than the maximum are being allocated to any individual organization.)

Look forward to your confirmation before Sunday August 20, and congratulations again,

Shasti

Senior Political Director | Washington State Democrats | 615 2nd Ave., Suite 580, Seattle, WA 98104

Phone | (206) 583-0664 Ext. 124

Rise and Organize | Become a Riser

Volunteer | wa-democrats.org/volunteer

Linktree | linktr.ee/washdems




Acct: XX

cFf: 010224

Tir: 2608
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Deposit to NON-PROFIT BASIC CHECKING BO
Amount : 2,000.00
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