Peq leland reported via email Wed, 18 Dec 2019 at 2:41PM
to: "PDC Support" pdc@pdc.wa.gov

Hi Tabatha,

Thank you. I've attached screen shots of the nextdoor.com conversation where another neighbor
called Kerry out for not having provided the required information. It was only then, much after
the election had concluded (and consistent with Kerry's voicemail and Doug's Nextdoor post
stating the information would be released only after the election) that the information was
provided.

| have also attached the DM in which Kerry provided the information on 11/16/19.
Please don't hesitate to let me know if | can provide any additional information.

Thank you,
Peg

On Tuesday, December 17, 2019, 05:54:03 PM PST, PDC Support <pdc@pdc.wa.gov> wrote:
Hi Peg,

Thank you for providing this information. This is very helpful! My apologies for the delay in
responding. | have been working on a time-sensitive project and have been away from my phone.

« Can you email me copies of what you received from Kerry Ticknor on 11/16/19? It
would be helpful to review what they provided.

Sincerely,

Tabatha Blacksmith
Compliance Coordinator

360.586.8929
Mi Public Disclosure Commission
4D S Shining Light on Washington Politics Since 1972

Washington State law established email as the PDC’s official means of communication as of
June 7th, 2018 (RCW 42.17A.055). Filers have a duty to amend their reports within 10 days of
any material changes, such as new email addresses. Please ensure your email address is up to
date.

To respond, please reply to this email.


https://wapdc.freshdesk.com/a/contacts/13039964858
mailto:pdc@pdc.wa.gov

Washington Public Disclosure Commission

http://www.pdc.wa.gov
1.360.753.1111
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On Fri, 13 Dec at 12:18 PM , Peg leland <peg2326@yahoo.com> wrote:


http://www.pdc.wa.gov/

on the November 2,

2018 ballot, In 2024
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additional $1.04 per

$1.000 in assessed
property value, The
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will occur when

I the bond Is
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other existing bonds
expire, and will ease
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Hello,

Thank you for your email. Here is the information you requested:
1) Yes, I still have the physical flyer. | have attached photos front and back.

2) | did not receive a response to that email, or any additional communication or response from
Doug Speas or the yes campaign email address (which Doug controls). However, after one of our
neighbors called out Kerry Ticknor personally and publicly on Nextdoor.com (for withholding
the information), she private messaged me and asked what information | was requesting. After a
couple message exchanges she furnished the requested information. This was on 11/16/19, well
after the election had passed. The date is consistent with her voicemail message stating they
would not release the information until after the election, and is also consistent with Doug's
public statement on Nextdoor.com to the same effect that they would not release any of the

information until after the election.

Please don't hesitate to let me know if | can provide any further information.

Thank you,



peg leland

On Friday, December 13, 2019, 10:40:21 AM PST, PDC Support <pdc@pdc.wa.gov> wrote:
Hi Peg,
Additional information is needed regarding your complaint against Yes for Camas Community

and Kerry Ticknor (PDC Case 59839). Towards this end, please kindly email me the following
information by next Friday, December 20, 2019:

In your complaint, you provided a snippet of a Nextdoor.com post wherein Doug Speas said "the
YES campaign paid for" the flyer.

o Do you still have the flyer? If so, please email me a copy of the back (reverse) side of the
flyer. 1t would be helpful to see what is written there.

You also indicated that you asked the committee to provide you with the names & occupations of
its contributors because this information was missing from the "records” they emailed you on
11/4. You also asked them to supply bank records.

o Did you ever receive any additional records from the committee beyond what they
emailed you at 11:45PM on 11/4? If so, please provide me with a copy of what you
received.

Any information you can provide is greatly appreciated. Please reply directly to this email
string (and do not change the Subject line) so that your response is routed directly to me in our
system and retained with the case.

Sincerely,

Tabatha Blacksmith
Compliance Coordinator

360.586.8929
i Public Disclosure Commission
40 = Shining Light on Washington Politics Since 1972

Washington State law established email as the PDC’s official means of communication as of
June 7th, 2018 (RCW 42.17A.055). Filers have a duty to amend their reports within 10 days of
any material changes, such as new email addresses. Please ensure your email address is up to
date.

To respond, please reply to this email.



Washington Public Disclosure Commission
http://www.pdc.wa.gov
1.360.753.1111

Nextdoor posts regarding lack of disclosure.docx
647.78 KB

DM chat with Kerry Ticknor 111619.docx
24.63 KB


http://www.pdc.wa.gov/
https://wapdc.freshdesk.com/helpdesk/attachments/13081577118
https://wapdc.freshdesk.com/helpdesk/attachments/13081577118
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Started on 11/16

Kerry Ticknor, Prune Hill Estates

Seems like based on the PDC complaint you did see the records. What is it you didn’t get?

You
Hi Kerry, thanks for contacting me. The only record that we received was the one page shown in the

PDC complaint, with 4 lines on it. It did not show who financed the signs or face book ads, as is
required disclosure by law.
Kerry Ticknor

Okay so no names were provided? I'll check it out when | get hime
Home
You

Thank you. | appreciate that.

Kerry Ticknor

| didn't have any records when you initially called me since it was all in-kind and no cash was
contributed so sorry for the delay/confusion. | have David Lugliani donating the signs and Doug
Speas donated the Facebook ads.

Thank you, | appreciate your response. The campaign laws also require recording the occupation
and address of anyone contributing more than a certain amount if cash or in-kind contributions (I
forget the amount, $100 or $250 or thereabouts). Do you also happen to have the occupation and
address of the contributor? | will not pass around his address, and | have no intentions of using the
information for anything other than knowledge of the contribution source. Thank you

Kerry Ticknor

| don't but can probably get it - the receipt doesn't include that information. I'll see what | can find. I'm
done posting on Nextdoor so I'll just provide what | can gather here.
You

no problem, and | appreciate it. | might assume it's this person: Manager Sansano Ventures so if |
am incorrect please let me know. Thanks again.

Hi Kerry, Also | forgot to ask if you could please include the details regarding the flyers. | don't see
them listed on your accounting, yet Doug indicated the Yes campaign paid for them. Thank you

Kerry Ticknor


https://nextdoor.com/profile/389123
https://nextdoor.com/profile/1583959
https://nextdoor.com/profile/389123
https://nextdoor.com/profile/1583959
https://nextdoor.com/profile/389123
https://nextdoor.com/profile/1583959
https://nextdoor.com/profile/389123
https://nextdoor.com/profile/1583959
https://nextdoor.com/profile/389123

No luck on the addresses yet but still trying. The $3105 includes flyers. 200 signs for $1550, 2 bigger
signs for $130 and 1425 8 1/2 x 11 flyers for $1425.

You
Thank you so much. Don’t worry about the address. | assume the occupation | sent you was the
correct person? Thank you again, i appreciate it.

Kerry Ticknor

Yes that's him.

You


https://nextdoor.com/profile/1583959
https://nextdoor.com/profile/389123
https://nextdoor.com/profile/1583959
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